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www.omnidelvecompany.com 

[Date] 

[Consumer Name]  

[Consumer Address] 

Dear [Consumer Name], 

We are excited to inform you that we completed the personal background check 
you ordered on [date]. Please understand that this letter does not constitute legal 
advice and any information pertained in is for informational purposes only. 

This OmniPersonal Findings report is separate from your actual background 
check report and is primarily created to reflect any derogatory information we 
found. The reason we have included this report separately is to indicate the 
following: 

1. The actual background check report is what the employer will see. 

2. This report is to reflect any information that we did find and why it is or is 
not included in your background check report we have furnished to you. 

Findings: 

● On [date], you were convicted of [crime] in [state]. You were sentenced to 
[sentence]. 

● On [date], you were arrested for [crime] in [state]. The charges were later 
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dropped. 

Explanation: 

We did not include the information about your arrest in your background check 
report because the charges were dropped. However, we have included it in this 
report for your information. 

It is important to note that employers may have different policies on whether or 
not to consider arrests in their hiring decisions. We recommend that you be 
prepared to discuss this information with any potential employers who ask about 
it. 

Statement of Rights: 

You have the right to request a review of any derogatory information in this report 
within 5 days of receiving it. If you dispute any of the information, please contact 
us in writing at [email address] or by filing a dispute online at 
https://getdispute.com/. We will investigate your dispute and provide you with a 
written response within 30 days. 

If you do not request a review within 5 days, this report will become final and the 
information will be included in your background check report. 

Enclosures: 

1. OmniPersonal Background Check Report 

2. PreAdverse Action Letter 

3. A summary of your state, local, and FCRA rights 

If you have any questions about this report, please do not hesitate to contact us. 

Sincerely, [Your Name] [Your Title] 
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[Disclaimer] 

The information contained in this report is for informational purposes only and 
does not constitute legal advice. This report is not intended to be a complete or 
exhaustive background check and should not be relied upon as such. You should 
consult with an attorney if you have any questions about your background check 
or your legal rights. 

 


